



# Project Home

**Customer Support Information**  
 appia-support@infotechfl.com  
 (352) 381-4888  
 (888) 352-2439

Columbus and Fernhill Sewer Separation (Bids Opened): This project will separate storm and sanitary sewers to reduce basement flooding and illicit dis...

[Reject Bids](#) • [Export](#) • [Project Security](#) • [Post Bid Data](#) • [Export Bid Tabs](#) • [Archive](#) • [Query](#)

**Overview** [Change](#)

**Description:** This project will separate storm and sanitary sewers to reduce basement flooding and illicit discharge of sewage.

**Work Type:**

**Date Advertised:** 06/19/2013

**Letting Date:** 07/02/2013

**Bids Due Time:** 02:00 PM

**EBS Filename:** Columbus\_and\_Fernhill\_Sewer\_Separation.ebs **Addendum Count:** 0

**Location:**

**Last Modification:** 07/02/2013

**Letting Location:** Purchasing Division

**Bids Open Time:** 02:00 PM

**Bids**

[Enter](#) [Load](#) [Fetch](#)

	Rank Contractor	Bid Total	% Deviation from Estimate	% Over Bid Items	Low Bid Complete?	
Award 1	E. R. Zeiler Excavating, Inc.	\$312,176.00	0.00%	Yes	Change X	
Award 2	Edward Kelly & Sons, Inc.	\$324,447.00	3.93%	Yes	Change X	
Award 3	Crestline Paving & Excavating Co Inc.	\$354,301.00	13.49%	Yes	Change X	
Award 4	Schoen, Inc.	\$373,324.50	19.59%	Yes	Change X	
Award 5	Anderzack-Pitzen Construction, Inc.	\$584,892.00	87.36%	Yes	Change X	
(5 Bids)	Engineer's Estimate:	\$0.00				

**Items**

**Time Limits** [Add](#)

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

1 of 56

OHIO  
UNIFORM

ARROW  
UNIFORM

HOWARD  
MCKARTY

Superior

500.<sup>00</sup> Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

3,500 Bid Bond  
1,500 Cert. Ck.  
2,000 Off. Ck.  
(2 checks) Cash. Ck.

500.<sup>00</sup> Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 Bib Overalls - yellow		(Majestic)				
2 Ladies Size						
3 S	60.54	N/A	NO BID			
4 M	60.54	16.95				
5 L	60.54					
6 XL	60.54					
7 XXL	64.40					
8 3XL	64.40					
9 4XL	64.40					
10 5XL	64.40					
11 6XL	67.00					
12 7XL	N/A	N/A				
13 Mens Size						
14 S	60.54	N/A				
15 M	60.54	16.95				
16 L	60.54					
17 XL	60.54					
18 XXL	64.40					
19 3XL	64.40					
20 4XL	64.40					
21 5XL	64.40					
22 6XL	67.00					
23 7XL	N/A	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

2 of 56

M H A A R M O

ARROW

HOWARD  
MOKIARTY

Superior

Bid Bond					
Cert. Ck.					
Off. Ck.					
Cash. Ck.					

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6	
1 ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 Parka - yellow with black bottom	NO SAMPLE	UTILITY PVD.					
2 Ladies Size	INCLUDED						
3 S	87.35	38.25	NO BID				
4 M	87.35						
5 L	87.35						
6 XL	87.35						
7 XXL	87.35						
8 3XL	87.35	N/A					
9 4XL	87.35						
10 5XL	87.35						
11 6XL	N/A						
12 7XL	N/A						
13 Mens Size							
14 S	87.35	N/A					
15 M	87.35	37.00					
16 L							
17 XL							
18 XXL							
19 3XL		38.00					
20 4XL							
21 5XL							
22 6XL	N/A	N/A					
23 7XL	N/A						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform  
 DEPT Purchasing  
 DATE 7/2/2013  
 3 of 56

PHARMACY

ARROW

HOWARD  
MORIARTY

Superior

Bid Bond					
Cert. Ck.					
Off. Ck.					
Cash. Ck.					

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 Parka - yellow		(Majestic)				
2 Ladies Size						
3 S	36.96	N/A	NO BID			
4 M		31.00				
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL						
8 3XL						
9 4XL						
10 5XL						
11 6XL	47.26					
12 7XL	N/A	N/A				
13 Mens Size						
14 S	36.96	N/A				
15 M		31.00				
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL						
19 3XL						
20 4XL						
21 5XL						
22 6XL	47.26					
23 7XL	N/A	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

4 of 56

**A  
H  
A  
R  
R  
O  
W**

*ARROW*

*H  
U  
A  
R  
D  
  
M  
O  
R  
I  
A  
R  
T  
Y*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	ANSI 102-2010 Class 3 Raingear (jacket and pants)-yellow						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>		(Majestic)				
3	S	32.41	N/A	NO BID			
4	M		25.43				
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL						
8	3XL						
9	4XL						
10	5XL						
11	6XL	51.03					
12	7XL	N/A	N/A				
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	32.41	N/A				
15	M		25.43				
16	L						
17	XL						
18	XXL						
19	3XL						
20	4XL						
21	5XL						
22	6XL	51.03					
23	7XL	N/A	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

5 of 56

**PHARM**

*ARROW*

*HOWARD  
MURPHY*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 - 2 in 1 bomber jacket - yellow w/black		(UTILITY PRO)				
2 Ladies Size						
3 S	38.88	N/A	NO BID			
4 M	↓	32.75	↓			
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL	42.49					
8 3XL	↓	34.75				
9 4XL						
10 5XL						
11 6XL	47.50	N/A				
12 7XL	47.50	↓				
13 Mens Size						
14 S	38.88	N/A				
15 M	↓	32.75				
16 L						
17 XL	↓					
18 XXL	42.49					
19 3XL	↓	34.75				
20 4XL						
21 5XL	↓					
22 6XL	47.50	N/A				
23 7XL	47.50	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

**000000**

*H.M.*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	<i>Item #5</i>		<i>(Utility Pro)</i>				
2							
3	<i>Ladies</i>						
4	<i>S</i>		<i>N/A</i>				
5	<i>M</i>		<i>38.75</i>				
6	<i>L</i>		↓				
7	<i>XL</i>						
8	<i>XXL</i>		↓				
9	<i>3X</i>		<i>40.75</i>				
10	<i>4X</i>		↓				
11	<i>5X</i>						
12	<i>6X</i>		<i>N/A</i>				
13	<i>7X</i>		↓				
14	<i>Mens</i>						
15	<i>S</i>		<i>N/A</i>				
16	<i>M</i>		<i>38.75</i>				
17	<i>L</i>		↓				
18	<i>XL</i>						
19	<i>XXL</i>		↓				
20	<i>3XL</i>		<i>40.75</i>				
21	<i>4XL</i>		↓				
22	<i>5XL</i>						
23	<i>6XL</i>		<i>N/A</i>				
	<i>7XL</i>		↓				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

**PHADNDN**

*H.M.*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Hem #5		(MAJESTIC)				
2	2 in 1 bomber jacket - yellow w/black						
3	loaves						
4	S		34.95				
5	M						
6	L						
7	XL						
8	XXL						
9	3XL						
10	4XL						
11	5XL						
12	6XL						
13	7XL						
14	MENS						
15	S						
16	M						
17	L						
18	XL						
19	XXL						
20	3XL						
21	4XL						
22	5XL						
23	6XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

6 of 56

09090909

ARROW

H.M

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS		1	2	3	4	5	6
1	ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 - 2 in 1 bomber jacket - yellow	NO SAMPLE INCLUDED 34.31 ↓ 39.46 ↓ 45.50 45.50 ↓ 34.31 ↓ 39.46 ↓ 45.50 45.50	(MAJESTIC)	NO BID			
2	Ladies Size						
3	S		30.88				
4	M						
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL						
8	3XL						
9	4XL						
10	5XL						
11	6XL						
12	7XL						
13	Mens Size						
14	S						
15	M						
16	L						
17	XL						
18	XXL						
19	3XL						
20	4XL						
21	5XL						
22	6XL						
23	7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

7 of 56

**PHADANA**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS		1	2	3	4	5	6
1	ANSI 107-2010 Class 3 Rain Jacket High visibility						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	34.31	NO SAMPLE (MAGNETIC) N/A	NO BID			
4	M	↓	16.00	↓			
5	L						
6	XL	39.46					
7	XXL	↓					
8	3XL						
9	4XL						
10	5XL						
11	6XL	43.00					
12	7XL	N/A	N/A				
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	34.31	N/A				
15	M	↓	16.00				
16	L						
17	XL	39.46					
18	XXL	↓					
19	3XL						
20	4XL						
21	5XL						
22	6XL	43.00					
23	7XL	N/A	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

8 of 56

A H A A H A M O

ARROW

H. M.

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 vests - high visibility		(Magstec)				
2 Ladies Size						
3 S	8.68	N/A	18.00			
4 M		13.00				
5 L						
6 XL			20.00			
7 XXL			22.00			
8 3XL			24.00			
9 4XL			26.00			
10 5XL						
11 6XL	N/A	N/A	N/A			
12 7XL	N/A	N/A	N/A			
13 Mens Size						
14 S	8.68	N/A	18.00			
15 M		13.00				
16 L						
17 XL			20.00			
18 XXL			22.00			
19 3XL			24.00			
20 4XL			26.00			
21 5XL						
22 6XL	N/A	N/A	N/A			
23 7XL	N/A	N/A	N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

9 of 56

**PHARM**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 vests w/zipper front - high visibility		(Majstra)				
2 Ladies Size						
3 S	9.37	N/A	NO BID			
4 M		13.00				
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL						
8 3XL						
9 4XL						
10 5XL						
11 6XL	N/A	N/A				
12 7XL	N/A	N/A				
13 Mens Size						
14 S	9.37	N/A				
15 M		13.00				
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL						
19 3XL						
20 4XL						
21 5XL						
22 6XL	N/A	N/A				
23 7XL	N/A	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

10 of 56

A H A R R O W

ARROW

H.M.

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 vests w/zipper front and radio holder - high visibility		(Majestic)				
2 Ladies Size						
3 S	11.02	N/A	17.75			
4 M	11.02	13.00	↓			
5 L	11.02	↓	↓			
6 XL	11.02	↓	19.75			
7 XXL	14.24	↓	23.75			
8 3XL	↓	↓	25.75			
9 4XL	↓	↓	N/A			
10 5XL	N/A	N/A	↓			
11 6XL	N/A	N/A	↓			
12 7XL	N/A	N/A	↓			
13 Mens Size						
14 S	11.02	N/A	17.75			
15 M	↓	13.00	↓			
16 L	↓	↓	↓			
17 XL	↓	↓	19.75			
18 XXL	14.24	↓	23.75			
19 3XL	↓	↓	25.75			
20 4XL	↓	↓	N/A			
21 5XL	N/A	N/A	↓			
22 6XL	N/A	N/A	↓			
23 7XL	N/A	N/A	↓			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

11 of 56

**PHARMA**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 Long Sleeve Shirts, Yellow						
2 Ladies Size		(Majestic)				
3 S	14.37	N/A	16.50			
4 M		17.50				
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL			18.50			
8 3XL			22.50			
9 4XL			24.50			
10 5XL			N/A			
11 6XL	N/A					
12 7XL	N/A					
13 Mens Size						
14 S	14.37	N/A	16.50			
15 M		14.50				
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL			18.50			
19 3XL			22.50			
20 4XL			24.50			
21 5XL			N/A			
22 6XL	N/A					
23 7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

12 of 56

A H A R R O W

A R R O W

H. M

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 Short Sleeve Shirts, Yellow						
2 Ladies Size		(Majestic)				
3 S	11.18	N/A	14.00			
4 M		13.35				
5 L						
6 XL			16.00			
7 XXL			20.00			
8 3XL			22.00			
9 4XL			N/A			
10 5XL						
11 6XL	N/A					
12 7XL	N/A					
13 Mens Size						
14 S	11.18	N/A	14.00			
15 M		13.35				
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL			16.00			
19 3XL			20.00			
20 4XL			22.00			
21 5XL			N/A			
22 6XL	N/A					
23 7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

13 of 56

**A  
H  
A  
R  
R  
O  
W**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 Short Sleeve Shirts, Yellow 50/50 blend						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	11.18	NO BID	NO BID			
4 M						
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL						
8 3XL						
9 4XL						
10 5XL						
11 6XL	N/A					
12 7XL	N/A					
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	11.18					
15 M						
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL						
19 3XL						
20 4XL						
21 5XL						
22 6XL	N/A					
23 7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

14 of 56

00000000

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond					
Cert. Ck.					
Off. Ck.					
Cash. Ck.					

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSJ Class 3 Long Sleeve Shirts, Yellow 50/50 blend						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	14.37	NO BID	NO BID			
4 M						
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL						
8 3XL						
9 4XL						
10 5XL	14.37					
11 6XL	N/A					
12 7XL	N/A					
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	14.37					
15 M						
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL						
19 3XL						
20 4XL						
21 5XL						
22 6XL	N/A					
23 7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

15 of 56

**PHOENIX**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 Polo Shirts, Yellow		(MAYNICK)				
2 Ladies Size						
3 S	14.18	N/A	NO BID			
4 M	↓	15.75	↓			
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL	19.33					
8 3XL	↓					
9 4XL						
10 5XL						
11 6XL	22.00					
12 7XL	N/A					
13 Mens Size						
14 S	14.18	N/A				
15 M	↓	15.75				
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL	19.33					
19 3XL	↓					
20 4XL						
21 5XL						
22 6XL	22.00					
23 7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

16 of 56

09000000

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS		1	2	3	4	5	6
1	ANSI Class 3 Crew Neck Sweatshirts - yellow		(Magnum)				
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	20.61	N/A	NO BID			
4	M		23.00				
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL						
8	3XL						
9	4XL						
10	5XL						
11	6XL	N/A	N/A				
12	7XL	N/A	N/A				
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	20.61	N/A				
15	M		23.00				
16	L						
17	XL						
18	XXL						
19	3XL						
20	4XL						
21	5XL						
22	6XL	N/A	N/A				
23	7XL	N/A	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

17 of 56

AHHHMM

ARROW

H.M.

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 Crew Neck Sweatshirts - yellow w/ black bottom						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	25.21	NO BID	NO BID			
4 M	↓					
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL	30.36					
8 3XL	↓					
9 4XL						
10 5XL						
11 6XL	35.57					
12 7XL	N/A					
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	25.21					
15 M	↓					
16 L						
17 XL	↓					
18 XXL	30.36					
19 3XL	↓					
20 4XL						
21 5XL	↓					
22 6XL	35.57					
23 7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

18 of 56

A H A H M M

*ARLOW*

*H M*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS		1	2	3	4	5	6
1	ANSI Class 3 Hooded Sweatshirts - yellow						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	<i>NO BID</i>	<i>NO BID</i>	<i>NO BID</i>			
4	M						
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL						
8	3XL						
9	4XL						
10	5XL						
11	6XL						
12	7XL						
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S						
15	M						
16	L						
17	XL						
18	XXL						
19	3XL						
20	4XL						
21	5XL						
22	6XL						
23	7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

19 of 56

PHARMACY

ARROW

H/M

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 Hooded Sweatshirts - yellow w/black bottom						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>		(MAJESTIC)				
3 S	28.52	N/A	NO BID			
4 M		24.60				
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL	33.67					
8 3XL						
9 4XL						
10 5XL						
11 6XL	38.82					
12 7XL	N/A	N/A				
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	28.52	N/A				
15 M		24.60				
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL	33.67					
19 3XL						
20 4XL						
21 5XL						
22 6XL	38.82					
23 7XL	N/A	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 DEPT Purchasing  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 DATE 7/2/2013  
 \_\_\_\_\_

**PHARMCO**

H.M.

Bid Bond					
Cert. Ck.					
Off. Ck.					
Cash. Ck.					

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	H.M. #19		(Magnetic)				
2							
3	LADIES S		N/A				
4	M		24.00				
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL						
8	3XL						
9	4XL						
10	5XL						
11	6XL						
12	7XL		N/A				
13	MENS						
14	S		N/A				
15	M		24.00				
16	L						
17	XL						
18	XXL						
19	3XL						
20	4XL						
21	5XL						
22	6XL						
23	7XL		N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

20 of 56

A H A A H M M

ARROW

H.M.

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ANSI Class 3 Hooded, Zipped Sweatshirts - yellow		(Utility Pro)				
2 Ladies Size						
3 S	26.53	N/A	40.00			
4 M		33.00				
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL			44.00			
8 3XL		35.00	48.00			
9 4XL			52.00			
10 5XL			N/A			
11 6XL	N/A	N/A				
12 7XL	N/A	N/A				
13 Mens Size						
14 S	26.53	N/A	40.00			
15 M		33.00				
16 L						
17 XL						
18 XXL			44.00			
19 3XL		35.00	48.00			
20 4XL			52.00			
21 5XL			N/A			
22 6XL	N/A	N/A				
23 7XL	N/A	N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

**PHARMO**

*H.M.*

Bid Bond  
 Cert. Ck.  
 Off. Ck.  
 Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	HCM TF20		(MAJESTIC)				
2							
3	LADIES S		N/A				
4	M		25.75				
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL						
8	3XL						
9	4XL						
10	5XL						
11	6XL						
12	7XL		N/A				
13	MENS						
14	S		N/A				
15	M		25.75				
16	L						
17	XL						
18	XXL						
19	3XL						
20	4XL						
21	5XL						
22	6XL						
23	7XL		N/A				

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

21 of 56

**A  
H  
A  
R  
R  
O  
W**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	ANSI Class 3 Hooded, Zipped Sweatshirts - yellow w/black bottom		(MAJESTIC)				
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	31.01	N/A	NO BID			
4	M	↓	24.40	↓			
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL	36.16					
8	3XL	↓					
9	4XL						
10	5XL						
11	6XL	41.31					
12	7XL	N/A	N/A				
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	31.01	N/A				
15	M	↓	24.40	↓			
16	L						
17	XL	↓					
18	XXL	36.16					
19	3XL	↓					
20	4XL						
21	5XL	↓					
22	6XL	41.31					
23	7XL	N/A	N/A	↓			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

22 of 56

**A  
H  
A  
R  
M  
O**

*ARROW*

*H.M*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	3 in 1 Parka - Multiple Colors						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	120.28	NO BID	95.00			
4	M	↓	↓	↓			
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL	126.69		101.00			
8	3XL	↓		107.00			
9	4XL			113.00			
10	5XL	N/A		N/A			
11	6XL	N/A					
12	7XL	N/A					
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	120.28		95.00			
15	M	↓		↓			
16	L						
17	XL						
18	XXL	126.69		101.00			
19	3XL	↓		107.00			
20	4XL			113.00			
21	5XL	N/A		N/A			
22	6XL	N/A					
23	7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

23 of 56

A H A H H H H

ASKAN

HAM.

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	2 in 1 Bomber Jacket - Multiple Colors						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	86.08	NO BID	75.00			
4	M	↓	↓	↓			
5	L						
6	XL	91.23		79.00			
7	XXL	↓		83.00			
8	3XL			87.00			
9	4XL	96.38		91.00			
10	5XL	↓		95.00			
11	6XL	N/A		N/A			
12	7XL						
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	86.08		75.00			
15	M	↓		↓			
16	L						
17	XL	91.23		79.00			
18	XXL	↓		83.00			
19	3XL			87.00			
20	4XL	96.38		91.00			
21	5XL	↓		95.00			
22	6XL	N/A		N/A			
23	7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

24 of 56

01111111

ARROW

H.M.

Super W

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS		1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Microfiber Jacket - Multiple Colors						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	35.50	NO BID	30.50			
4	M	↓			↓		
5	L						
6	XL	37.30			32.50		
7	XXL	↓			36.50		
8	3XL				38.50		
9	4XL	N/A			N/A		
10	5XL	N/A					
11	6XL	N/A					
12	7XL	N/A					
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	35.50			30.50		
15	M	↓		↓			
16	L						
17	XL	37.30		32.50			
18	XXL	↓		36.50			
19	3XL			38.50			
20	4XL	N/A		N/A			
21	5XL	N/A					
22	6XL	N/A					
23	7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

25 of 56

OHIO

ARROW

H.M.

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Long Sleeve Shirts Moisture Wicking - Multiple Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>		(MAJESTIC) NO SAMPLE				
3 S	12.71	N/A	7.00			
4 M	↓	14.95	↓			
5 L	↓	↓	↓			
6 XL	16.74	↓	10.00			
7 XXL	↓	↓	13.00			
8 3XL	N/A	↓	18.00			
9 4XL	↓	↓	20.00			
10 5XL	↓	↓	N/A			
11 6XL	↓	↓	↓			
12 7XL	↓	↓	↓			
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	12.71	N/A	7.00			
15 M	↓	14.95	↓			
16 L	↓	↓	↓			
17 XL	16.74	↓	10.00			
18 XXL	↓	↓	13.00			
19 3XL	N/A	↓	18.00			
20 4XL	↓	↓	20.00			
21 5XL	↓	↓	N/A			
22 6XL	↓	↓	↓			
23 7XL	↓	↓	↓			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

26 of 56

AHHHHH

ARROW

H.M.

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Short Sleeve Shirts Moisture Wicking - Multiple Colors		(MAJESTIC)				
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>		NO SAMPLE				
3	S	4.47	N/A	5.25			
4	M	↓	13.35	↓			
5	L	↓	↓	↓			
6	XL	6.25	↓	8.25			
7	XXL	↓	↓	11.25			
8	3XL	N/A	↓	14.50			
9	4XL	↓	↓	16.50			
10	5XL	↓	↓	N/A			
11	6XL	↓	↓	↓			
12	7XL	↓	↓	↓			
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	4.47	N/A	5.25			
15	M	↓	13.35	↓			
16	L	↓	↓	↓			
17	XL	6.25	↓	8.25			
18	XXL	↓	↓	11.25			
19	3XL	N/A	↓	14.50			
20	4XL	↓	↓	16.50			
21	5XL	↓	↓	N/A			
22	6XL	↓	↓	↓			
23	7XL	↓	↓	↓			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

27 of 56

A H A H H H H

ARROW

H.M.

Superior

Bid Bond					
Cert. Ck.					
Off. Ck.					
Cash. Ck.					

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Short Sleeve Shirts 50/50 - Multiple Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	7.59	NO BID	3.50			
4 M	↓			↓		
5 L						
6 XL	10.11			5.50		
7 XXL	N/A			5.75		
8 3XL				5.75		
9 4XL				N/A		
10 5XL						
11 6XL						
12 7XL						
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	3.85		3.50			
15 M	↓		↓			
16 L						
17 XL	6.23		5.50			
18 XXL			5.75			
19 3XL			5.75			
20 4XL			N/A			
21 5XL						
22 6XL	N/A					
23 7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

28 of 56

**PHADANON**

*Arrow*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Long Sleeve Shirts 50/50 - Multiple Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	6.66	NO BID	6.00			
4 M						
5 L						
6 XL	↓		↓			
7 XXL	9.02		7.75			
8 3XL	↓		8.00			
9 4XL	N/A		8.25			
10 5XL			N/A			
11 6XL	↓		↓			
12 7XL						
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	6.66		6.00			
15 M	↓		↓			
16 L						
17 XL	↓		↓			
18 XXL	9.02		7.75			
19 3XL	↓		8.00			
20 4XL	N/A		8.25			
21 5XL			N/A			
22 6XL	↓		↓			
23 7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

29 of 56

A H A H M M M

ARCON

HAM

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Polo Shirts - Multiple Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	13.24	NO BID	11.50			
4 M	↓	↓	↓			
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL	15.43			13.50		
8 3XL	↓			17.50		
9 4XL	N/A			N/A		
10 5XL	↓			↓		
11 6XL						
12 7XL	↓			↓		
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	13.24		11.50			
15 M	↓		↓			
16 L						
17 XL	↓		↓			
18 XXL	15.43		13.50			
19 3XL	N/A		17.50			
20 4XL	↓		19.50			
21 5XL	↓		21.50			
22 6XL	↓		23.50			
23 7XL	↓		N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

30 of 56

**A  
H  
A  
R  
R  
O  
W**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Crew Neck Sweatshirts - Multiple Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	9.17	NO BID	10.00			
4 M	↓	↓	↓			
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL	11.46			12.25		
8 3XL	↓			12.50		
9 4XL	↓			12.75		
10 5XL	↓			N/A		
11 6XL	N/A			↓		
12 7XL	N/A					
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	8.88			10.00		
15 M	↓			↓		
16 L						
17 XL	↓					
18 XXL	11.10		12.25			
19 3XL	↓		12.50			
20 4XL	↓		12.75			
21 5XL	N/A		N/A			
22 6XL	↓		↓			
23 7XL	↓		↓			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

31 of 56

**A  
H  
A  
R  
R  
O  
W**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Hooded Sweatshirts - Multiple Colors						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	15.32	<i>NO BID</i>	17.75			
4	M	↓	↓	↓			
5	L						
6	XL	18.87		19.75			
7	XXL	↓		23.75			
8	3XL	↓		25.75			
9	4XL	↓		29.75			
10	5XL	N/A		31.75			
11	6XL	N/A		N/A			
12	7XL	N/A					
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	15.32		17.75			
15	M	↓		↓			
16	L						
17	XL	18.87		19.75			
18	XXL	↓		23.75			
19	3XL	↓		25.75			
20	4XL	↓		29.75			
21	5XL	N/A		31.75			
22	6XL	N/A		N/A			
23	7XL	N/A					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

32 of 56

OHIO

ARROW

HAM

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Hooded, Zipped Sweatshirts - Multiple Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	21.78	X10 BID	21.50			
4 M	↓		↓			
5 L						
6 XL	24.67			23.50		
7 XXL	↓			27.50		
8 3XL	↓			29.50		
9 4XL	↓			33.50		
10 5XL	N/A			35.50		
11 6XL	N/A		N/A			
12 7XL	N/A					
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	21.78		21.50			
15 M	↓		↓			
16 L						
17 XL	↓		↓			
18 XXL	24.67		23.50			
19 3XL	↓		27.50			
20 4XL	↓		29.50			
21 5XL	N/A		33.50			
22 6XL	↓		35.50			
23 7XL	↓		N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

33 of 56

**PHARM**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Turtleneck Long Sleeve Shirts - Multiple Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	14.70	NO BID	14.25			
4 M	↓			↓		
5 L	18.44			16.25		
6 XL	↓			20.25		
7 XXL	↓			22.25		
8 3XL	N/A			N/A		
9 4XL	↓			↓		
10 5XL	↓			↓		
11 6XL	↓			↓		
12 7XL	↓			↓		
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	14.70			14.25		
15 M	↓		↓			
16 L	18.44		16.25			
17 XL	↓		20.25			
18 XXL	↓		22.25			
19 3XL	N/A		N/A			
20 4XL	↓		↓			
21 5XL	↓		↓			
22 6XL	↓		↓			
23 7XL	↓		↓			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

34 of 56

**ARROW**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Long Sleeve Industrial Shirts, 8 button - Multiple Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	13.24	NO BID	11.75			
4 M	↓			↓		
5 L						
6 XL	15.30			14.10		
7 XXL	↓			↓		
8 3XL	N/A			N/A		
9 4XL	↓					
10 5XL						
11 6XL						
12 7XL						
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	13.24			11.75		
15 M	↓		↓			
16 L						
17 XL	15.30		14.10			
18 XXL	15.30		↓			
19 3XL	↓					
20 4XL	N/A					
21 5XL	↓					
22 6XL						
23 7XL			N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

35 of 56

AHHHHH

ARROW

H.M.

SUPERIOR

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Moisture Wicking Polo Shirt - Two-Tone Colors						
2 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
3 S	20.96	NO BID	12.75			
4 M	↓		↓			
5 L						
6 XL						
7 XXL	25.47		15.30			
8 3XL	↓		16.58			
9 4XL	N/A		N/A			
10 5XL	↓		↓			
11 6XL						
12 7XL	↓		↓			
13 <u>Mens Size</u>						
14 S	20.96		12.75			
15 M	↓		↓			
16 L						
17 XL	↓		↓			
18 XXL	25.47		15.30			
19 3XL	↓		16.58			
20 4XL			16.58			
21 5XL	↓		19.13			
22 6XL	N/A		19.13			
23 7XL	N/A		N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

36 of 56

**PHOENIX**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Moisture Wicking Long-Sleeve Polo Shirt Two Toned						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	28.70	NO BID	NO BID			
4	M	↓	↓	↓			
5	L						
6	XL						
7	XXL	32.89					
8	3XL	↓					
9	4XL						
10	5XL	N/A					
11	6XL	↓					
12	7XL						
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	28.70					
15	M	↓					
16	L						
17	XL	↓					
18	XXL	32.89					
19	3XL	↓					
20	4XL						
21	5XL	N/A					
22	6XL	↓					
23	7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

37 of 56

AHHHHH

ARROW

H.M.

Superior

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS		1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Moisture Wicking Long Sleeve Polo Shirt						
2	3 button, single color, multi color opt						
3	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
4	S	N/A	NO BID	12.75			
5	M						
6	L						
7	XL						
8	XXL			14.75			
9	3XL			N/A			
10	4XL						
11	5XL						
12	6XL						
13	7XL						
14	<u>Mens Size</u>						
15	S	10.50		12.75			
16	M						
17	L						
18	XL						
19	XXL	15.00		14.75			
20	3XL			18.75			
21	4XL			20.75			
22	5XL			24.75			
23	6XL	N/A		26.75			
24	7XL	N/A		N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

38 of 56

**AHARRON**

*ARROW*

*HM*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Moisture Wicking Long Sleeve Polo Shirt -						
2 3 button, single color, multi color opt						
3 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
4 S	19.11	NO BID	NO BID			
5 M	↓					
6 L	21.17					
7 XL	↓					
8 XXL	N/A					
9 3XL	↓					
10 4XL	↓					
11 5XL	↓					
12 6XL	↓					
13 7XL	↓					
14 <u>Mens Size</u>						
15 S	19.11					
16 M	↓					
17 L	↓					
18 XL	↓					
19 XXL	21.17					
20 3XL	↓					
21 4XL	↓					
22 5XL	N/A					
23 6XL	↓					
24 7XL	↓					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

39 of 56

**PHOENIX**

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Moisture Wicking Polo Shirt -						
2 4 button, single color, multi color opt						
3 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
4 S	10.56	NO BID	11.50			
5 M						
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL	15.64		13.80			
9 3XL			14.95			
10 4XL	N/A		N/A			
11 5XL						
12 6XL						
13 7XL						
14 <u>Mens Size</u>						
15 S	N/A		11.50			
16 M						
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL			13.80			
20 3XL			14.95			
21 4XL			14.95			
22 5XL			17.25			
23 6XL			17.25			
24 7XL			N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

40 of 56

**AHARRON**

*AKON*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Moisture Wicking Long Sleeve Polo Shirt -	NO SAMPLE INCLUDED	NO BID				
2 4 button, single color, multi color opt						
3 Ladies Size						
4 S	19.11		14.00			
5 M	↓		↓			
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL	21.17			16.80		
9 3XL	↓			18.20		
10 4XL	↓			18.20		
11 5XL	N/A			21.00		
12 6XL	↓		NO BID			
13 7XL	↓		↓			
14 Mens Size						
15 S	19.11		14.00			
16 M	↓		↓			
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL	21.17			16.80		
20 3XL	↓			18.20		
21 4XL	↓			18.20		
22 5XL	N/A			21.00		
23 6XL	↓		21.00			
24 7XL	↓		N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

41 of 56

A H A H M M M

*ARROW*

*H.M.*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS		1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Moisture Wicking Short Sleeve Two-toned Polo Shirt -						
2	Multiple Colors						
3	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
4	S	16.17	NO BID	14.00			
5	M						
6	L						
7	XL						
8	XXL	18.66		16.00			
9	3XL	N/A		N/A			
10	4XL						
11	5XL						
12	6XL						
13	7XL						
14	<u>Mens Size</u>						
15	S	16.17		14.00			
16	M						
17	L						
18	XL						
19	XXL	18.66		16.00			
20	3XL			20.00			
21	4XL			22.00			
22	5XL	N/A		N/A			
23	6XL						
24	7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

42 of 56

**A  
H  
A  
R  
R  
O  
W**

*ARROW*

*HAR*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Moisture Wicking Long Sleeve Two-toned Polo Shirt -						
2 Multiple Colors						
3 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
4 S	28.70	NO BID	NO BID			
5 M	↓					
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL	32.89					
9 3XL	↓					
10 4XL						
11 5XL	N/A					
12 6XL	↓					
13 7XL						
14 <u>Mens Size</u>						
15 S	28.70					
16 M	↓					
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL	32.89					
20 3XL	32.89					
21 4XL	32.89					
22 5XL	N/A					
23 6XL	↓					
24 7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

43 of 56

AHHHHH

*ARLOW*

*HAM*

*Superna*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Long Sleeve Dress Shirts						
2 Multiple Colors w/Buttndown Collars, 8 button						
3 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
4 S	N/A	NO BID	14.50			
5 M						
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL			16.50			
9 3XL			20.50			
10 4XL			22.50			
11 5XL			26.50			
12 6XL			28.50			
13 7XL			N/A			
14 <u>Mens Size</u>						
15 S	23.18		14.50			
16 M						
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL	24.72		16.50			
20 3XL			20.50			
21 4XL	N/A		22.50			
22 5XL			26.50			
23 6XL			28.50			
24 7XL			N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

44 of 56

**AHANN**

*ARROW*

*H/M*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Long Sleeve Dress Shirts	NO SAMPLE					
2 Multiple Colors w/o Buttondown Collars, 8 button						
3 Ladies Size						
4 S	N/A	NO BID	NO BID			
5 M						
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL						
9 3XL						
10 4XL						
11 5XL						
12 6XL						
13 7XL						
14 Mens Size						
15 S	22.71					
16 M						
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL	28.32					
20 3XL						
21 4XL						
22 5XL	N/A					
23 6XL						
24 7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

45 of 56

**PHOENIX**

*ARROW*  
 Bid Bond  
 Cert. Ck.  
 Off. Ck.  
 Cash. Ck.

*H&M*  
 Bid Bond  
 Cert. Ck.  
 Off. Ck.  
 Cash. Ck.

*Superior*  
 Bid Bond  
 Cert. Ck.  
 Off. Ck.  
 Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Long Sleeve Dress Shirts						
2 Multiple Colors w/o Buttondown Collars, 5 button						
3 Ladies Size						
4 S	24.36	NO BID	NO BID			
5 M						
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL	26.42					
9 3XL	N/A					
10 4XL						
11 5XL						
12 6XL						
13 7XL						
14 Mens Size						
15 S	N/A					
16 M						
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL						
20 3XL						
21 4XL						
22 5XL						
23 6XL						
24 7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

46 of 56

**PHOENIX**

*ARROW*  
 Bid Bond  
 Cert. Ck.  
 Off. Ck.  
 Cash. Ck.

*HMC*  
 Bid Bond  
 Cert. Ck.  
 Off. Ck.  
 Cash. Ck.

*Superior*  
 Bid Bond  
 Cert. Ck.  
 Off. Ck.  
 Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Long Sleeve Dress Shirts						
2	Multiple Colors w/ Buttondown Collars, 5 button						
3	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
4	S	24.37	NO BID	NO BID			
5	M						
6	L						
7	XL						
8	XXL						
9	3XL	N/A					
10	4XL						
11	5XL						
12	6XL						
13	7XL						
14	<u>Mens Size</u>						
15	S	N/A					
16	M						
17	L						
18	XL						
19	XXL						
20	3XL						
21	4XL						
22	5XL						
23	6XL						
24	7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

47 of 56

**PHOENIX**

*Arrow*

*H/M*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Short Sleeve Dress Shirts			NO SAMPLE			
2 Multiple Colors w/o Buttondown Collars, 5 button						
3 <u>Ladies Size</u>						
4 S	20.39	NO BID	14.50			
5 M	↓	↓	↓			
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL	21.42		16.50			
9 3XL	N/A		20.50			
10 4XL			22.50			
11 5XL			26.50			
12 6XL			28.50			
13 7XL			N/A			
14 <u>Mens Size</u>						
15 S	22.56		14.50			
16 M	↓		↓			
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL	24.10		16.50			
20 3XL	↓		20.50			
21 4XL	N/A		22.50			
22 5XL			26.50			
23 6XL			28.50			
24 7XL			N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

48 of 56

**A  
H  
A  
R  
O  
N**

*ARROW*

*AM*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Short Sleeve Dress Shirts						
2 Multiple Colors w/o Buttdown Collars, 5 button						
3 Ladies Size						
4 S	20.39	NO BID	NO BID			
5 M	↓					
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL	21.42					
9 3XL	N/A					
10 4XL	↓					
11 5XL						
12 6XL						
13 7XL	↓					
14 Mens Size						
15 S	22.56					
16 M	↓					
17 L						
18 XL	↓					
19 XXL	24.10					
20 3XL	↓					
21 4XL	N/A					
22 5XL	↓					
23 6XL						
24 7XL	↓					

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

49 of 56

**AHANN**

*Arrow*

*AM*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Short Sleeve Uniform Polo Shirt w/microphone keeper						
2 Multiple Colors						
3 Ladies Size						
4 S	N/A		41.25			
5 M						
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL			45.38			
9 3XL			45.38			
10 4XL			45.38			
11 5XL			45.38			
12 6XL			45.38			
13 7XL			N/A			
14 Mens Size						
15 S			41.25			
16 M						
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL			45.38			
20 3XL						
21 4XL						
22 5XL						
23 6XL						
24 7XL			N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 DEPT Purchasing  
 \_\_\_\_\_  
 DATE 7/2/2013  
 \_\_\_\_\_

M H A N N O

Superior

Bid Bond					
Cert. Ck.					
Off. Ck.					
Cash. Ck.					

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	#49 (alternate)						
2							
3	LADIES S			21.00			
4	M			↓			
5	L						
6	XL			↓			
7	XXL			23.00			
8	3XL			27.00			
9	4XL			29.00			
10	5XL						
11	6XL						
12	7XL						
13	MENS'						
14	S			21.00			
15	M			↓			
16	L						
17	XL			↓			
18	XXL			23.00			
19	3XL			27.00			
20	4XL			29.00			
21	5XL						
22	6XL						
23	7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

50 of 56

A H A H A H A

*ARLOW*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

*HAM*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6	
1 Long Sleeve Uniform Polo Shirt w/microphone keeper							
2 Multiple Colors							
3 <u>Ladies Size</u>							
4 S	NO BID	NO BID	25.00				
5 M	↓	↓					
6 L							
7 XL							
8 XXL					27.00		
9 3XL					31.00		
10 4XL					33.00		
11 5XL					N/A		
12 6XL							
13 7XL							
14 <u>Mens Size</u>							
15 S			25.00				
16 M	↓	↓					
17 L							
18 XL							
19 XXL					27.00		
20 3XL					31.00		
21 4XL					33.00		
22 5XL					N/A		
23 6XL							
24 7XL							

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

51 of 56

A H A H A H A

*ARLOW*

*HAM*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS		1	2	3	4	5	6	
1	ColdGear Compression Short Sleeve T-shirt							
2	Multiple Colors							
3	<u>Ladies Size</u>							
4	S	NO BID ↓	NO BID ↓	14.75				
5	M							
6	L							
7	XL							
8	XXL					16.75		
9	3XL					18.75		
10	4XL					N/A		
11	5XL							
12	6XL							
13	7XL							
14	<u>Mens Size</u>							
15	S					14.75		
16	M							
17	L							
18	XL							
19	XXL			16.75				
20	3XL			18.75				
21	4XL			N/A				
22	5XL							
23	6XL							
24	7XL							

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

52 of 56

**01111111**

*AKRON*

*HM*

*Superior*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ColdGear Compression Long Sleeve Mock						
2 Multiple Colors						
3 Ladies Size						
4 S	NO BID	NO BID	16.50			
5 M	↓	↓	↓			
6 L			18.50			
7 XL			20.50			
8 XXL			N/A			
9 3XL						
10 4XL						
11 5XL						
12 6XL						
13 7XL						
14 Mens Size						
15 S			16.50			
16 M			↓			
17 L			18.50			
18 XL			20.50			
19 XXL			N/A			
20 3XL						
21 4XL						
22 5XL						
23 6XL						
24 7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

53 of 56

**PHOENIX**

*ARROW*

*AM*

*Supernova*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	ColdGear Compression Leggings						
2	Multiple Colors						
3	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
4	S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			
5	M	↓	↓	↓			
6	L						
7	XL						
8	XXL						
9	3XL						
10	4XL						
11	5XL						
12	6XL						
13	7XL						
14	<u>Mens Size</u>						
15	S						
16	M						
17	L						
18	XL						
19	XXL						
20	3XL						
21	4XL						
22	5XL						
23	6XL						
24	7XL						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

54 of 56

**AHARRON**

*ARROW*

*HAM*

*Supernov*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 ColdGear Tackle Twill Fleece Hoody						
2 Multiple Colors						
3 Ladies Size						
4 S	NO BID	NO BID	N/A 27.00			
5 M						
6 L						
7 XL						
8 XXL			30.00			
9 3XL			N/A			
10 4XL						
11 5XL						
12 6XL						
13 7XL						
14 Mens Size						
15 S			27.00			
16 M						
17 L						
18 XL						
19 XXL			30.00			
20 3XL			33.00			
21 4XL			36.00			
22 5XL			39.00			
23 6XL			N/A			
24 7XL			N/A			

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

55 of 56

**OHIO**

*ARROW*

*HM*

*Supern*

Bid Bond  
Cert. Ck.  
Off. Ck.  
Cash. Ck.

ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1 Stenciling Back of Garment (qty / price)	N/A		N/A			
2						
3 Embroidery on Front of Garment (qty / price)	SEE BID	NO BID	SEE BID			
4						
5 Sewing Patches on garment - 1 (qty / price)						
6						
7 Sewing Multiple Patches on Garment (up to 3) ( qty / price)						
8						
9 Silk Screening Back of Garment (qty / price)						
10						
11 Silk Screening Front of Garment, Left Chest (qty / price)						
12						
13 Silk Screening Front of Garment, Across Front (qty / price)						
14						
15 City of Toledo Fire Department patches (50 qty)	8.50		7.25			
16						
17 City of Toledo Department of Public Service Patches (1000 qty)	3.50		See bid			
18						
19 City of Toledo Division of Engineering Services Patches (1000 qty)	3.50		See bid			
20						
21 City of Toledo, Division of Water Distribution Patches (250 qty)	3.50		See bid			
22						
23 City of Toledo Division of Environmental Services patches (50 qty)	3.50		See bid			
24						

# RECORD OF BIDS

FOR City Wide Uniform

DEPT Purchasing

DATE 7/2/2013

56 of 56

01111111

*ARROW*

*HAM*

*Superior*

Bid Bond					
Cert. Ck.					
Off. Ck.					
Cash. Ck.					

	ITEMS	1	2	3	4	5	6
1	Bowling Shirts - Multiple Colors						
2	<u>Ladies Size</u>						
3	S	22.05	NO BID	NO BID			
4	M	↓	↓	↓			
5	L						
6	XL	24.05					
7	XXL	↓					
8	3XL						
9	4XL	↓					
10	5XL	N/A					
11	6XL	↓					
12	7XL						
13	<u>Mens Size</u>						
14	S	22.05					
15	M	↓					
16	L						
17	XL	↓					
18	XXL	24.05					
19	3XL	↓					
20	4XL						
21	5XL	N/A					
22	6XL	↓					
23	7XL						
24							