
City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     4/29/14

Item Description Packing 4

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

5

$__________

1

Cash Ck.

2 3

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

KM
 F

ox
 F

ar
m

s

$____N/A______ $__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

 FOR:       FARM 48+ TILLABLE ACRES

  DEPT:     ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

To
m

 K
ei

l &
 S

on
s 

Fa
rm

s

$____N/A______
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

A) Rent
    5/15/2014 - 5/14/2015

B) Renewal Term(s)
    With annual option to renewal for _____years at a per acre rate of $_____ acre.

161.00$  

4 yrs / $161.00

Per acre/per year Per acre/per year Per acre/per year Per acre/per year Per acre/per year

90.00$  

3 yrs / $90.00



$_____5,000.00_____$_____5%______ $___________ $_____200,000.00____$___________ $___________
Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond
Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck.
Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck.

Price per Unit to 
Inlcude Delivery as 

noted

Price per Unit to 
Inlcude Delivery as 

noted
Price per Unit to Inlcude 

Delivery as noted

Price per Unit to 
Inlcude Delivery as 

noted
Price per Unit to Inlcude 

Delivery as noted

Price per Unit to 
Inlcude Delivery as 

noted
Material Number Material Description 1 2 3 4 5 6

Item 1.A.
BULK DE-ICING SALT - F.O.B. SUPPLIER MINES 71.46$                       No Bid

65 dollars and zero 
cents

Item 1.B. BULK DE-ICING SALT - F.O.B. SUPPLIER DEPOT 71.99$                       73.27$                       NO BID 
Item 1.C. BULK DE-ICING SALT - DELIVERED, UNLOADED AND PILED BY TRUCK TO TOLEDO 80.52$                       No Bid NO BID 70.94
Item 1.D. BULK DE-ICING SALT - DELIVERED AND UNLOADED BY SHIPLOAD TO TOLEDO 60.74$                       72.13$                       48.95

Item 2.A. BULK DE-ICING SALT - F.O.B. SUPPLIER MINES 82.50$                       No Bid
65 dollars and zero 

cents
Item 2.B. BULK DE-ICING SALT - F.O.B. SUPPLIER DEPOT 75.63$                       73.27$                       NO BID 
Item 2.C. BULK DE-ICING SALT - DELIVERED, UNLOADED AND PILED BY TRUCK TO OREGON 77.63$                       No Bid 70.94
Item 2.D. BULK DE-ICING SALT - DELIVERED, UNLOADED AND PILED BY TRUCK TO OREGON 77.63$                       No Bid 70.94
Item 2.E. BULK DE-ICING SALT - DELIVERED AND UNLOADED BY SHIPLOAD TO OREGON AT 60.74$                       70.87$                       48.95

FOR:       2014-2015 BULK DE-ICING SALT  1-1172

DEPT:     DPS/STREETS, BRIDGES & HARBOR
DATE:     4/29/13
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                                   CITY OF TOLEDO BID SHEET



City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     4/29/14
Unit Price 

per ft.
Total Price 

per coils
Total price 
per length

Unit Price 
per ft.

Total Price 
per coils

Total price per 
length

Unit Price 
per ft.

Total Price 
per coils

Total price per 
length

Material Number Material Description
COPPER COILS

10034269

6,000 FT. (100 COILS) - ¾” SOFT COPPER TUBING,
TYPE “K” to be in 60’ coils, in accordance with the
attached specifications, or approved equal. 3.70$       

 $222 (per 
100 coils) N/A

10033989

6,000 FT. (100 COILS) - 1” SOFT COPPER TUBING, 
TYPE “K” to be in 60’ coils, in accordance with the 
attached specifications, or approved equal. 4.85$         

 $291 (per 
100 coils)  N/A 

10033989

5,000 FT. (50 COILS) - 1” SOFT COPPER TUBING, 
TYPE “K”  to be in 100’ coils, in accordance with attached 
specifications, or approved equal. 4.85$         

 $485 (per 
50 coils)  N/A 

COPPER STICKS (STRAIGHT LENGTHS) 

10053971

400 FT. (20 lengths) - 1 ½” SOFT COPPER TUBING, 
TYPE “K” to be in 20’ straight lengths, in accordance with 
attached specifications, or approved equal. 10.25$       N/A

 $205 (per 
20 length) 

10053972

600FT.  (30 lengths) - 2” SOFT COPPER TUBING, 
TYPE “K” to be in 20’ straight lengths, in accordance with 
attached specifications, or approved equal. 15.95$       N/A

 $319 (per 
30 length) 

Total Bid Price

 FOR:       COPPER TUBING
                  

  DEPT:     DPU/WATER DISTRIBUTION

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

89,220.00$                                           

1 2 3

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

HD
 S

up
pl

y

5%

Cash Ck.

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.



                          City of Toledo Bid Sheet

 FOR:      RFP for HRLF 2014 Gas Collection and Control System

  DEPT:     DPS/Solid Waste
  DATE:     4/29/14

Total 
Estimated 

Project 
Hours

Total Project 
Cost

Total 
Estimated 

Project 
Hours

Total Project 
Cost

Total 
Estimated 

Project 
Hours

Total Project 
Cost

Total 
Estimated 

Project 
Hours

Total 
Project 

Cost

Total 
Estimated 

Project 
Hours

Total 
Project 

Cost

Item Description
Management Level

Chairman/CEO/COO/CFO/President
Principal or VP 12 1,980.00$    4 832.00$        18 3,510.00$    

Senior Project Manager 8 1,160.00$    52 9,360.00$    
Project Manager 81 8,505.00$    

Government & Community Relations
Senior GIS Coordinator

Subtotal Management Level 101 11,645.00$  56 10,192.00$  18 3,510.00$    
.

Staff Level
Senior Engineer, P.E. 46 6,330.00$    24 4,320.00$    24 3,600.00$    

Senior Hydrogeologist
Senior Scientist

Project Engineer 32 3,360.00$    144 18,546.00$  40 5,480.00$    
Project Hydrogeologist

Project Scientist
Staff Engineer 46 4,370.00$    

Staff Hydrogeologist

Off. Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Co
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$___N/A_______

Ci
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$___N/A_______
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

CB
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$___N/A_______
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

1

Cash Ck.

2 3

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

4

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

5

$__________



Staff Scientist 16 1,360.00$    28 2,884.00$    
Senior Designer

Designer
CAD Operator 26 2,340.00$    48 3,312.00$    18 1,710.00$    

Senior Technician 20 2,340.00$    
Technician

Administrative Support 5 305.00$        8 512.00$        
Clerical

Subtotal Staff Level 166 17,760.00$  249 29,367.00$  110 10,042.00$  

Project Manpower Distribution Totals 267 29,405.00$  305 39,559.00$  128 17,152.00$  



City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     4/29/14

$__________

Cash Ck.

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

3

 FOR:       RFP FOR MEDICAL STOP LOSS INSURANCE

  DEPT:     HUMAN RESOURCES

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

He
al
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sc
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Be
ne
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s

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

1 2Service



City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     4/29/14

Material Number Material Description

Item 1.A.
COVERING OF BULK DE-ICING SALT PILE - TOLEDO 
DOCK FACILITY  *INCLUDES UNCOVERING EXISTING 
PILE BEFORE NEW SHIPMENT (IF REQUESTED)*

Item 1.B. COVERING OF BULK DE-ICING SALT PILE - CITY OF 
OREGON - GRADEL (ARMS) DOCK FACILITY

Item 2.A. END OF SEASON CLOSING OF BULK DE-ICING SALT - 
TOLEDO DOCK FACILITY

Item 2.B. END OF SEASON CLOSING OF BULK DE-ICING SALT - 
GRADEL (ARMS) DOCK FACILITY - CITY OF OREGON

Price per unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

Price per unit to Inlcude Delivery 
as noted

Price per unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

0.57$                                

42 3

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Off. Ck.

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

5

$__________

Cash Ck.

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Cash Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck. Cash Ck.

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Price per unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

Ra
yn

er
 C

ov
er

in
g 

Sy
st

em
s I
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.

$___2040.00____

Price per unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

0.65$                                

0.33$                                

0.33$                                

 FOR:       2014-2015 COVERING OF BULK DE-ICING SALT PILE  1-1175
                  

  DEPT:     DPS/STREETS, BRIDGES & HARBOR

1





City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     4/29/14
Crew Rate / 

per hour
Additional 

Charges
Crew Rate 
/ per hour

Additional 
Charges

Crew Rate 
/ per hour

Additional 
Charges

Crew Rate 
/ per hour

Additional 
Charges

Crew Rate 
/ per hour

Additional 
Charges

Material Number Material Description

20000613
Removal/ Disposal of Soda Ash or Lime (Chem Strg 
Bldg) 587.60$   NA 176.00$   117.42$   

20000613
Removal /Disposal of Soda Ash or Lime (Chem feed 
Bldg) 587.60$   NA 325.48$   132.68$   

Total Bid Price

5

In
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$__________

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Off. Ck.

4

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.
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$__________
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5%
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

M
ol

e 
M
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5%
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

non responsive

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

68,749.20$                   

non responsive

40,561.28$                   

Cash Ck.

2 3

 FOR:       WATER TREATMENT PLANT CHEMICAL BIN CLEANOUT

  DEPT:     DPU/WATER TREATMENT
Cash Ck.

1

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.


	4.29.13 Farm Tillable Acres
	SHEET

	4.29.14 Bulk Salt
	Goods

	4.29.14 Copper Tubing
	SHEET

	4.29.14 HRLF GCCS
	SHEET

	4.29.14 Medical Stop Loss
	SHEET

	4.29.14 Salt Pile
	SHEET

	4.29.14 Watermain Loop Closure
	4.29.14 WTP Chemical Cleanout
	SHEET




