
City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     6/10/14
Estimated Hours Total Cost Estimated Hours Total Cost Estimated Hours Total Cost Estimated Hours Total Cost Estimated Hours Total Cost

328 36,801.60$              

440 49,368.00$              

256 28,723.20$              

137,871.36$            

3.0

B. Submittal Review and Approval
C. Change Orders

Total Multiplier

G. As-built Drawings
Total for Office Engineering

Total Project Cost*

Multiplier; Indirect labor
Multiplier; Profit & Overhead

2.3. B, Blower Intake
2.3. C, Filter System

D. Project Start-up

2.3. E, Final Cost Estimate
2.3. Design Memorandum
2.4. Bidding Services 
Total Design Cost Final Design

Article 2.7 Office Engineering during Construction
A. Contract Management

2.2. A, HVAC System
2.2. B, Blower Intake

2.3. D, Bridge Crane

2.2. C, Filter System
2.2. D, Bridge Crane
2.2. E, Preliminary Cost Estimate
Total Preliminary Design Cost

Article 2.3 Final Design Elements
2.3. A, HVAC System

 FOR:       BLOWER BUILDING AND VENTILATION IMPROVEMENT
                NO. 55B

  DEPT:     DPU/Water Reclamation

Material Number
Article 2.2 Preliminary Design Report

Off. Ck.Off. Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
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$___N/A_______ $__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Cash Ck.

51

Cash Ck.

2 3

Cash Ck. Cash Ck.

$__________

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

4

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.



City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     6/10/14
Material Mark-up 

% over cost
Labor Rate $ per 

hour Other Charges
Material Mark-up

% over cost
Labor Rate $ per 

hour Other Charges
Material Mark-up 

% over cost
Labor Rate $ per 

hour Other Charges

$__________

Cash Ck.

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

3

 FOR:       SEVERN TRENT CHLORINE SYSTEM PARTS
AND SERVICES

  DEPT:     DPU/WATER RECLAMATION

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.Off. Ck.

Cash Ck.

1 2
Supply Severn Trent parts, components and services for the 
Chlorine System. 

Material Description

No Bidders 



$_____N/A___ $_____N/A___ $_____N/A___ $_____N/A___ $_____N/A___ $___________
Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond
Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck.
Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck.

Item Number Detailed Description 1 2 3 4 5 6
SAFETY BUILDING

1 Housekeeping Task

Total Monthly Hours: 480 563 490 550
Flat Rate for Monthly 
Janitorial 

Labor Hourly Rate for tasking: 20.00$                      16.92$                    17.50$                            19.70$                           
N/A (Rate is based on 
$19.00 per hour)

Total Monthly Cost: 9,600.00$                9,525.96$              8,575.00$                       10,835.00$                   
$8,600.00 Fixed Flat 
Rate

2

Hourly labor costs for emergency  non-scheduled services or 
for additional work with tasking of light bulb changing, 
sidewalk snow removal and salting near buildings.  Extra labor 
for flood clean-up.  City will honor labor laws for overtime and 
any material expenses.  This is not a substitute for major 
flood/fire restoration work by licensed contractors.

Straight time hourly rate: 25.00$                      16.92$                    25.00$                            19.70$                           20.00$                           

3
Submit square foot cost to clean carpeting per specifications 
and general guidelines.     

Carpet Cleaning (per square foot): N/A 16.92$                    $0.22 per sq ft 0.07$                             0.20$                             

(OT $21.26)

4
Submit square foot cost to strip/wax hard floor surfaces per 
specifications and general guidelines.

                                   CITY OF TOLEDO BID SHEET

FOR:       JANITORIAL SERVICES FOR DOWNTOWN BUILDINGS

DEPT:     DPS/FACILITY AND FLEET
DATE:     6/10/14
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Hard Surface Flooring (per square foot): N/A N/A $0.22 per sq ft 0.35$                             0.20$                             

5

Submit cost of emergency cleaning needs of body fluid, 
including cost of required sanitizing kit for each occurrence.

Emergency Cleaning of Body Fluids: 45.00$                      
$16.92 + $15.75 

for kit
$25.00 per hour + 

$25.00 kit 25.95$                           45.00$                           

REGIONAL CRIMINAL JUSTICE CENTER
1 Housekeeping Task

Total Monthly Hours: 490.00$                   606 747.5 575
Flat Rate for Monthly 
Janitorial 

Labor Hourly Rate for tasking: 20.00$                      16.92$                    17.50$                            19.70$                           
N/A (Rate is based on 
$19.00 per hour)

Total Monthly Cost: 9,800.00$                10,253.52$            13,081.25$                    11,327.50$                   
$8,200.00 Fixed Flat 
Rate

2

Hourly labor costs for emergency  non-scheduled services or 
for additional work with tasking of light bulb changing, 
sidewalk snow removal and salting near buildings.  Extra labor 
for flood clean-up.  City will honor labor laws for overtime and 
any material expenses.  This is not a substitute for major 
flood/fire restoration work by licensed contractors.

Straight time hourly rate: 25.00$                      16.92$                    25.00$                            19.70$                           20.00$                           

3
Submit square foot cost to clean carpeting per specifications 
and general guidelines.     

Carpet Cleaning (per square foot): N/A N/A $0.22 per sq ft 0.07$                             0.20$                             

4
Submit square foot cost to strip/wax hard floor surfaces per 
specifications and general guidelines.

Hard Surface Flooring (per square foot): N/A 0.24$                      $0.22 per sq ft 0.35$                             0.20$                             

5

Submit cost of emergency cleaning needs of body fluid, 
including cost of required sanitizing kit for each occurrence.



Emergency Cleaning of Body Fluids: 45.00$                      
$16.92 + $15.75 

for kit
$25.00 per hour + 

$25.00 kit 25.95$                           45.00$                           

ALARMS BUILDING
1 Housekeeping Task

Total Monthly Hours: 86 130 53.5 160
Flat Rate for Monthly 
Janitorial 

Labor Hourly Rate for tasking: 20.00$                      16.92$                    17.50$                            19.70$                           
N/A (Rate is based on 
$19.00 per hour)

Total Monthly Cost: 1,720.00$                2,199.60$              936.25$                          3,152.00$                     
$2,000.00 Fixed Flat 
Rate

2

Hourly labor costs for emergency  non-scheduled services or 
for additional work with tasking of light bulb changing, 
sidewalk snow removal and salting near buildings.  Extra labor 
for flood clean-up.  City will honor labor laws for overtime and 
any material expenses.  This is not a substitute for major 
flood/fire restoration work by licensed contractors.

Straight time hourly rate: 25.00$                      16.92$                    25.00$                            19.70$                           20.00$                           

3
Submit square foot cost to clean carpeting per specifications 
and general guidelines.     

Carpet Cleaning (per square foot): N/A N/A $0.22 per sq ft 0.07$                             0.20$                             

4
Submit square foot cost to strip/wax hard floor surfaces per 
specifications and general guidelines.

Hard Surface Flooring (per square foot): N/A 0.24$                      $0.22 per sq ft 0.35$                             0.20$                             

5

Submit cost of emergency cleaning needs of body fluid, 
including cost of required sanitizing kit for each occurrence.

Emergency Cleaning of Body Fluids: 45.00$                      
$16.92 + $15.75 

for kit
$25.00 per hour + 

$25.00 kit 25.95$                           45.00$                           

RIVERSIDE CONCOURSES
1 Housekeeping Task



Total Monthly Hours: No Bid 34 280 40
Flat Rate for Monthly 
Janitorial

Labor Hourly Rate for tasking: No Bid 16.92$                    17.50$                            19.70$                           
N/A (Rate is based on 
$19.00 per hour)

Total Monthly Cost: No Bid 575.28$                  4,900.00$                       788.00$                        
$750.00 Fixed Flat 
Rate

2

Hourly labor costs for emergency  non-scheduled services or 
for additional work with tasking of light bulb changing, 
sidewalk snow removal and salting near buildings.  Extra labor 
for flood clean-up.  City will honor labor laws for overtime and 
any material expenses.  This is not a substitute for major 
flood/fire restoration work by licensed contractors.

Straight time hourly rate: No Bid 16.92$                    25.00$                            19.70$                           20.00$                           

3
Submit square foot cost to clean carpeting per specifications 
and general guidelines.     

Carpet Cleaning (per square foot): No Bid N/A $0.22 per sq ft 0.07$                             0.20$                             

4
Submit square foot cost to strip/wax hard floor surfaces per 
specifications and general guidelines.

Hard Surface Flooring (per square foot): No Bid 0.24$                      $0.22 per sq ft 0.35$                             0.20$                             

5

Submit cost of emergency cleaning needs of body fluid, 
including cost of required sanitizing kit for each occurrence.

Emergency Cleaning of Body Fluids: No Bid
$16.92 + $15.75 
for kit

$25.00 per hour + 
$25.00 kit 25.95$                           45.00$                           



City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     6/10/14

Minimum Order Qty
Price per Unit to 
Include Delivery Minimum Order Qty

Price per Unit to 
Include Delivery Minimum Order Qty

Price per Unit to 
Include Delivery Minimum Order Qty

Price per Unit to 
Include Delivery Minimum Order Qty

Price per Unit to 
Include Delivery

45,000 lbs $5,000.00/ton

Trade Name of Materials

0

CAIROX Potassium Permanganate

Guarnateed Analysis of KMn04
Discount for prompt payment ____% 30 days

7 

97%

NSF/ANSI 60 certified chemical used in the treatment of drinking water.

 FOR:       135 TONS (MORE OR LESS) BULK POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE

  DEPT:     DPU/Water Treatment

Delivery of each load will be made in ____ calendar days fropm date of notice to ship

Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Material Number

Cash Ck.
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$___5%_______ $__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

$__________
Bid Bond

1

Cash Ck.

2 3

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

4

$__________
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

5

$__________



$______5%_____ $___________ $___________ $___________ $___________ $___________
Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond
Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck.
Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck.

Price per Unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

Price per Unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

Price per Unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

Price per Unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

Price per Unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

Price per Unit to Inlcude 
Delivery as noted

Item Number Detailed Description 1 2 3 4 5 6
1 Dive Inspections & Report 30,000.00$                  
2 Transfer Conduit Repair 20,000.00$                  
3 Conduit Repairs Near Gate #5  12,000.00$                  
4 Conduit Construction Joint Repair North of East Reservoir Weir 12,000.00$                  
5 Conduit Construction Joint Repair North of East Reservoir Gate 21,126.00$                  
6 Reservoir Top Slab Repairs  $                100,000.00 
7 Column Repair 10,000.00$                  
8 Access Hatch Repairs 296,000.00$                
9 Elevated Tank Concrete Pier Repair 10,000.00$                  

10 Peripheral Drain Pumping Station Repair 100,000.00$                

11 Contingency Allowance (per Section 01019) 40,000.00$                  

12 Grand Total 651,126.00$                
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                                   CITY OF TOLEDO BID SHEET

FOR:       RESERVOIR AND CONDUIT IMPROVEMENTS

DEPT:     DPU/WATER TREATMENT
DATE:     6/10/14



$___2,550.00___ $___________ $___________ $___________ $___________ $___________
Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond
Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck.
Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck.

Unit Price to Include 
Delivery

Unit Price to Include 
Delivery

Unit Price to Include 
Delivery

Unit Price to Include 
Delivery

Unit Price to Include 
Delivery

Unit Price to Include 
Delivery

Item Number Detailed Description 1 2 3 4 5 6
10026808 THM Analyzer $51,000.00
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                                   CITY OF TOLEDO BID SHEET

FOR:       WATER TREATMENT PLANT THM ANALYZER

DEPT:     DPU/WATER TREATMENT
DATE:     6/10/14
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