
City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     6/17/14

Unit Price Additional Charges Unit Price Additional Charges Unit Price Additional Charges

Item Number Material Number
1 Lens Options

Single 15.00$                            
Bifocal 19.00$                            
Trifocal 24.00$                            
Double Segment (CR 39only) 52.50$                            
High Index Plastic lenses

Single 14.00$                            
Multi 23.00$                            

Aspheric lenses
Single 10.00$                            
Multi 20.00$                            

Video Terminal lenses
Single 20.00$                            
Multi 35.00$                            

Special Options
14X35mm Trifocal lenses

Single N/A
Multi N/A

2 Progessive lenses
Sola SL Bi-focal

Cash Ck.
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$___1,000.00_______ $__________

1

Cash Ck.

2

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

 FOR:       CITYWIDE SAFETY GLASSES
                

  DEPT:     HUMAN RESOURCES
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Bid Bond

Off. Ck.

Bid Bond
$__________

3

Cash Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cert. Ck.



Single N/A
Multi 30.00$                            

Sola Sl Tri-focal
Single N/A
Multi 30.00$                            

Sola VIP Tri-focal
Single N/A
Multi 30.00$                            

Double segment other than 13mm 
Single N/A
Multi 9.00$                              

Cateracts, lenticulars, quadrafocals, other special 
lenses

Single N/A
Multi 55.00$                            

3 Tints & Coatings
Solid Tints (green, gray, rose,etc.) Plastic 

Single 3.00$                              
Multi 3.00$                              

Gradient Tints (Plastic & Poly material)
Single 3.00$                              
Multi 3.00$                              

Photochromic Glass 
Single 7.00$                              
Multi 20.00$                            

Solid Tints (green, gray, rose,etc.) Glass
Single 33.00$                            
Multi 52.00$                            

Transitions
Single 20.00$                            
Multi 35.00$                            

UV 400 Coating
Single 4.00$                              
Multi 4.00$                              

Anti-Reflective Coating
Single 18.00$                            



Multi 18.00$                            
Scratch Resistant Coating (CR-32 Plastic)

Single No Charge
Multi No Charge

Rolled & Polished Lense Edges
Single 4.00$                              
Multi 4.00$                              

Polariod
Single 20.00$                            
Multi 20.00$                            

4 Additional Options
Spring-hinge (flex action temple) option

Single Inc. select frames
Multi Inc. select frames

Adjustiabel Nosepads on Plastic Frames
Single 5.00$                              
Multi 5.00$                              

Cable Temples on Plastic Frames
Single N/A
Multi N/A

Detachable or Permanent Sideshields
Single 2.50$                              
Multi 5.50$                              

Optician Dispensing Fee per Unit
Single 20.00$                            
Multi 20.00$                            

5 Style - Frames Comparable
1. Titmus Optical EX255 28.00$                            
2. Titmus PC1 or PC1U 14.00$                            
3. Titmus PC8 23.00$                            
4. Titmus PC250 or PC250SW 23.00$                            
5. Titmus PC251 23.00$                            
6. Titmus PC4 23.00$                            
7. Titmus PC205 23.00$                            
8. Titmus FC421 18.00$                            



9. Titmus FC601 18.00$                            
10. Titmus FC701U* 14.50$                            
11. Titmus TM6* 18.00$                            
12. Titmus TM10* 18.00$                            
13. Titmus Astro RX3003* 9.50$                              
14. Titmus SC900 9.00$                              
15. Titmus SC900 Integrated 9.00$                              
16. Titmus SP-83 9.00$                              
17. Titmus SP-83BF 9.00$                              
18. Titmus TR301S 27.00$                            
19. Titmus TR 302S 27.00$                            
20. Titmus TR303 27.00$                            
21. Titmus TR304 27.00$                            
22. Titmus TR305 27.00$                            
23. Titmus BC101 19.20$                            
24. Titmus BC102 19.20$                            
25. Titmus BC103 19.20$                            
26. Titmus BC104 19.20$                            
27. Titmus BC106 19.20$                            
28. Titmus 107 14.00$                            
29. Titmus BC108 14.00$                            
30. Titmus BC109 19.20$                            
31. Titmus EXT7 50.00$                            
32. Titmus EXT3 50.00$                            
33. Titmus EXT2 5.00$                              
34. Titmus 70-F 9.00$                              
*Add for Cable Temples (Titmus) 27.00$                            
35. Titmus Criss Mag 1 20.00$                            
36. Titmus Detachable Sideshields 2.50$                              
37. Titmus Permanently Attached Sideshields 5.50$                              
38. Titmus 7894 3M Respirator RX Kit 147.00$                         
39. 760022 North Respirator RX Kit 84.00$                            
40. 804638 MSA RX Kit 40.00$                            



City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     6/17/14

Unit Price Additional Charges Unit Price Additional Charges Unit Price Additional Charges

1 6702 Men's Slip on N/A
Full Dark Brown Worn Saddle Leather 
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane SD; 
Shank: Non-metallic; 224 Opanka

Sizes: B 10-12, 13, 14; D 6-12, 13, 14, 15; EE 8-12, 13

2 Men's 5-inch Hiker Boot N/A
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane 
Shank:IC-Tech, 697, Cement              
14; H 8-12, 13

3 2223 Men's 6-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain Black Turbo Vegas Leather
Shank: Fiberglass, 694, Supersole®Welt
Sizes: A-10-12, 13; B 9-12, 13, 14, 15; C 9-12, 13; D 6-
12,13,  14, 15,  16; E 8-12, 13: EE 5, 5½, 6-12, 13, 14, 15: 
H-12, 13

4 Men's 6-inch Boot N/A

Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Hazelnut Tramper Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane
Shank: Non-metallic, 800, Direct Attach
Sizes: B 10-12, 13, 14: D 7-12, 13, 14, 15; EE 7-12, 13, 14; 
H 8-12, 13

5 Men's 6-inch Boot N/A

Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Hazelnut Tramper Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane SD

3

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

Sa
fe

ty
 S

ol
ut

io
ns
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Bid Bond
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$____5%______
Bid Bond

Material Number

$89.04 NA

1

NA

$97.49 NA

$90.99 NA

Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

2

 FOR:       CITYWIDE SAFETY SHOES
                

  DEPT:     HUMAN RESOURCES

$87.09 NA

$84.49



Shank: Non-metallic, 800, Direct Attach
Sizes: D 6-12, 13, 14; EE 8-12, 13, 14;

6 Men's 6-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Nutmeg Ebbtide Leather
Footbed: Comfort Force®

Shank: Fiberglass, 694, Dual Density, Supersole®Welt
Sizes: B 10-12, 13, 14; D 7-12, 13, 14, 15; E 8-12, 13; 
EEE8-12, 13

7 Men's 6-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Calico Brawny Leather
Footbed: Comfort Force®

Shank: Fiberglass, 694, Dual Density, Supersole®Welt
Sizes: D 7-12, 13, 14, 15; E 8-12, 13; EEE8-12, 13, 4

8 Men's 8-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Black Yukon Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane
Shank: Fiberglass, 694, Supersole®Welt
Sizes: D 7-12, 13, 14, 15; EE 8-12, 13, 14; H 8-12,13

9 Men's 6-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain Dark Brown Pueblo Leather
Footbed: Removable Polyrethane
Shank: Steel, 703, Goodyear Welt
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14; WW 8-12, 13, 14

10 Women's Oxford N/A
Upper: Full Grain Brown Worn Saddle Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane SD
Shank: Non Metallic, 302 Opanka
Sizes: B 5-10, 11; D5-10; EE 5-10

11 Women's Oxford N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Water-Resistant Black Nature Soft 
Leather
Footbed: SD Foil-Felt Cushion
Shank: Steel, 323 Cement
Sizes: D 4-10

12 Women's Athletic N/A
Upper: Full Grain Black Leather
Footbed:  Removable Covered Polyurethane
Shank: Non-metallic, 228, Cement

$109.19 NA

$62.39 NA

$84.49 NA

$120.00 NA

$106.59 NA

$83.19 NA

$110.49 NA



Sizes: B 5-10; D 5-10; EE 5-10

13 Women's 5-inch Hiker Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Edgewater Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane
Shank: TC-Tech, 697, Cement
Sizes: B 5-10; D 5-10; EE 6-10

14 Women's 5-inch Boot N/A

Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Hazelnut Tramper Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane
Shank: Non-metallic, 800, Direct Attach
Sizes: B 5-10; D 5-10; EE 6-10

15 Men's Slip-On N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Water-Resistant Black Star Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane SD
Shank: Non-metallic, 225, Opanka
Sizes: B 10-12, 13, 14, D7-12, 13,1 4, 15; EE 8-12, 13

16 Men's 6-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Nutmeg Ebbtide Leather
Footbed: Comfort Force®

Shank: Fiberglass, 694, Dual Density, Supersole®Welt
Sizes: B 10-12, 13, 14; D 7-12, 13, 14, 15; E 8-12; EEE 8-
12, 13

17 Men's 8-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Brown Taos Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane
Shank: Non-metallic, 156, Cement-Welt

Sizes: D 7-12, 13, 14,15; EE 8-12, 13, 14; H 8-12, 13, 14

18 4174 Women's Oxford N/A
Upper: Full Grain Black Leather
Footbed: Polyurethane
Shank: Non-metallic, RDS801-5L, Cement
Sizes: B 6-10, 11; D 6-10

19 6691 Men's Athletic N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Black Star Leather
Footbed: Removable Polyurethane
Shank: Steel, 221, Cement
Sizes: D 7-12, 13, 14, 15; EE 8-12, 13, 14

$90.99 NA

$90.34 NA

$84.49 NA

$97.49 NA

$58.49 NA

$97.49 NA

$89.69 NA



20 Men's 8-inch Boot N/A

Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Hazelnut Tramper Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane
Shank: Non-metallic, 800, Direct Attach
Size: D 7-12, 13, 14, 15; EE 7-12, 13, 14; H 8-12, 13

21 Men;s 6-inch Hiker Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain Black Star Leather
Footbed: Nylon Covered Polyurethane
Shank: Steel, 221, Cement
Sizes: D 7-12, 13, 14, 15; EE 8-12, 13, 14

22 Men's 8-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Full Grain, Waterproof Dark Gambler Leather
Footbed: Redbed™ featuring Agion®anti-microbial 
treatment
Shank: Fiberglass, 694, Supersole®Welt
Sizes: B 10-12, 13, 14; D 7-12, 13, 14, 15, 16; EE 7-12, 13, 
14; H 8-12, 13

23 Men's Athletic N/A
Upper: Nubuck Black Leather and Nylon Mesh
Footbed: Removable Polyurethane-SD
Shank: Steel, 882, Cement
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14; WW 8-12, 13, 14

24 Men's 6-inch Boot N/A
Upper: Polyurethane Coated Waterproof Leather
Footbed: Removable Polyurethane
Shank: Non-metallic, 800, Dement
Sizes: M 8-12, 13, 14; WW 8-12, 13

25 Men's Oxford N/A
Upper: Polyurethane Coated Black Leather
Footbed: Removable Polyurethane
Shank: Non-metallic, 882, Cement
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14; WW 8-12, 13

26 Men's 6-inch Boot, Timberland PRO N/A
Upper: Black Briar Full Grain Leather Upper
Footbed: Anti-Fatigue Architecture w/Polyurethane
Shank: Cement Construction
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14, 15; W 7-12, 13,1 4,15

27 Men's 6-inch Boot, Timberland PRO N/A

$70.84 NA

$56.54 NA

$119.59 NA

$110.00 NA

$75.39 NA

$64.99 NA

$98.00 NA



Upper: Brown Premium Waterproof Leather 
w/Everguard™Foot
Footbed: Open-Cell PU 
Shank:  Cast Bond Construction
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14, 15; W 7-12, 13,1 4,15

28 Men's 6-inch Boot, Carhartt N/A
Upper: Brown Waterproof Bison Harness Leather
Footbed: Removable OrthoLite®Insole
Shank: Steel
Sizes: M 8-12, 13; W 8-12, 13, 14, 15

29 Men's 6-inch Boot, Wolverine N/A
Upper: Brown Waterproof Full Grain Leather 
w/SwampMonster TPU Shell
Footbed: Removable Air Cell Polyurethane Cushion
Shank: Nylon Shank
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14; XW 7-012, 13

30 Men's 6-inch Boot, Wolverine N/A
Upper: Brown Full Grain Leather 
Footbed: Removable Full Cushion 
Shank: Goodyear™Welt Construction
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14; XW 7-12, 13

31 Men's 6-inch Boot, Thorogood N/A
Upper: Brown Walnut Oil Tanned Badlands Leather

Footbed: Removable Polyurethane Ultimate 
SDPoron®Comfort Cushion w/AntiFatigue Filler System 
Shank: Goodyear™Welt Construction
Sizes: A 9-11, 12; B 4-12, 13; C 9-12, 13; D 4-12, 13, 14, 
15, 16, 17, 18; E 6-12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17,18; EEE 6-12, 13, 
14,1 5, 16, 17, 18

32 Men's Dress Casual, Rockport Works N/A
Upper: Black Full Grain Leather
Footbed: Removable insole
Shank: Nylon, Cement Construciton
Sizes: N 7-11, 12, 13, 4; W 7-11, 12, 13, 14

33 Men's Dress Casual, Florsheim N/A
Upper: Brown Full Grain Leather 
Footbed: Removable F2A Dual Density Polyurethane 
Cushion Insole
Shank: Steel, Direct Attach Construction
Sizes: D 6-11, 12, 13, 14; EEE 6-11, 12, 13, 14

$123.49 NA

$105.00 NA

$90.00 NA

$102.04 NA

$85.79 NA

$131.94 NA

$84.49 NA



34 Men's Pull-On N/A
Upper: Black 10" Pistop Leather
Footbed: Removable 7-Layer Double Comfort System
Shank: Welt Construction
Sizes: B 9-12, 13; D7-12, 13, 14; EE 6-12, 13; EEE 6-12, 
13

35 Men's Insulated Waterproof Boots, Wolverine N/A
Upper: Brown Waterproof Full Grain Leather
Footbed: Removable Compression Molded EVA 
Shank: Nylon, Goodyear™Welt Construction
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14; XW 7-12, 13

36 Men's Insulated Waterproof Boots, Timberland PRO N/A
Upper: Tan Nubuck Waterproof Leather
Footbed: 24-7™Comfort Suspension System w/Removable 
PU Cushion
Shank:  Steel; Direct Attach Construction
Sizes: M 7-12, 13, 14, 15; W 7-12, 13, 14, 15

37 Women's Steel Toe, Reebok N/A
Upper: Black Suede Leather & Mesh w/Pink Trim
Footbed: Removable EVA Cushion Insert w/Sponge 
Rubber Heel Wedge
Shank: Cement Construction
Sizes: M 6-12; W 6-12

38 Women's Alloy Toe, Timberland PRO N/A
Upper: Brown Wateproof Leather

Footbed: Removable Contoured Open-Cell Polyurethane
Shank: Cement Construction
Sizes: M 5½-10, 11; W 5½-10, 11

39 Women's Composite Toe, Rockport Works N/A
Upper: Brown Full Grain Tumbled Leather 
Footbed: Removable adiPRENE®by Adidas™ Schock 
Absorbing
Shank: Fiberglass, Direct Attach Construction
Sizes: M 6-12; W 6-12

40 Women's Steel Toe, Iron Age N/A
Upper: Brown Tumbled Leather w/ Black Rubber Vamp
Footbed: Removable EVA Cushion Insert w/Sponge 
Rubber Heel Wedge
Shank: Cement Construction

$139.49 NA

$118.94 NA

NA

$85.79

$98.79 NA

NA

$102.69 NA

$97.49 NA

$74.74



Sizes: W 6-11; XW 6-11

41 Men's Metatarsal, Work One N/A
Upper: Brown Hazelnut Crazy Horse Leather
Footbed: Removable Full Length Polyurethane

Shank: Fiberglass Shank, Goodyear™Welt Construction
Sizes: E 8-12, 13, 14; EEE 8-12, 13

Police & Fire

1
Men's Leather Oxford, Black Smooth High Shine 
Leather Upper; Goodyear Welt $52.99 (Win #834-6041)
Construction; Slip Resisting Vibram®EVA Outsole; Comfort 
Weaver Lining; Plus $10.00
Removable Poly-Pillow Footpacer™Insole; Rubber Midsole; 
FiberglassShank

2
Men's Poromeric Oxford; Black Easy-to-care for Hgh 
Gloss Poromeric Upper; $81.99 (Bates #941)
Goodyear Storm Welt Construction; Slip Resisting Vibram® 
EVA Outsole; Comfort
Weave Lining; Removable Poly-Pillow Footpacer™ Insole; 
Rubber Midsole; Fiberglass
Shank

3
Men's Cross Trainer Oxford; Black Full Grain Glove 
Soft Leather Upper; Cement $72.99 (Rocky #2168)
Construction with Side Wall Stitch; Vibram® Enforcer Slip 
and Abrasion-Resisting Plus $8.00
rubber Outsole; Comfort Weave Lining; Removable Poly-
Pillow Footpacer™ Insole; 
Fiberglass Shank

4
Men's Cross Trainer; Full Grain Glove Soft Leather 
Upper; Cement Construction $87.99 (Bates #3204)
with Side Wall Stitch; Vibram®Enforcer Slip & Abrasion-
Resisting Rubber Outsole;
Comfort Weave Lining; Removable Poly-Pillow Footpacer™ 
Insole; Fiberglass Shank

5
Men's 8"  Waterproof Boot; Black Full Grain 
Leather/1000 Denier Cordura®Upper; $112.99 (Bates #2268)
Cement Construction; Rubber Vibram®Trail Run Mini-Lug 
Outsole; Woven Nylon
Lining; Polyurethane Removable Insert; Polyurethane 
Midsole; Fiberglass Shank; 
Speed-lace Closure; Sympatex®Waterproof Barrier; 
Bloodborne Pathogen Compliant

$107.24 NA

$164.44 NA

$89.04 NA

$92.94 NA

$126.09 NA

$116.99 NA



6
Men's 8" Insulated & Waterproof Boot; Combination 
Black Boulder Waterproof $115.99 (Bates #2488)
Leather & Condura®Upper; Direct Injection Construction; 
Vibram® Heavy Duty
Logger Outsole; B-400 Thinsulate™ Insulation; Comfort 
Weave Lining; Removable Felt
Footbed; Polyurethane Midsole; Fiberglass Shank; 
Sympatex® Waterproof Barrier,
Bloodborne Pathogen Compliant

7
Women's Oxford; Black Smooth High Shine Leather 
Upper;Goodyear Welt $52.99 (Win #834-6041)
Construction; Slip Resisting Vibram®EVA Outsole; Comfort 
Weaver Lining; Plus $10.00
Removable Poly-Pillow Footpacer™Insole; Rubber 
Midsole; FiberglassShank

8
Women's Cross Trainer Oxford; Black Full Grain Glove 
Soft Leather Upper; Cement $87.99 (Bates #3204
Construction with Side Wall Stitch; Vibram® Enforcer Slip 
and Abrasion-Resisting
rubber Outsole; Comfort Weave Lining; Removable Poly-
Pillow Footpacer™ Insole; 
Fiberglass Shank

9
Women's Waterproof; Black Full Grain Leather/1000 
Denier Cordura® Upper; $83.99 (Win #834-6219)
Cement Construction; Rubber Vibram®Trail Run Mini-Lug 
Outsole; Woven Nylon Plus $10.00
Lining; Polyurethane Removable Insert; Polyurethane 
Midsole; Fiberglass Shank; 
Speed-lace Closure; Sympatex®Waterproof Barrier; 
Bloodborne Pathogen Compliant

10
Men's Lightweight 8" Side Zip Black Waterproof; Black 
Action $83.99 (Win #834-6219)
Leather/1200 denier Nylon Upper; Cement Construction; 
Two Density Rubber Outsole Plus $10.00
With Integrated EVA Impact Pads; Two Zone Wicking 
Mesh Lining; Removable Two
Density Polyurethane Shoch Zone Insert With Air Flow 
Vents; Plastic Shank; Total  
Non-Metallic; Heavy Duty YKK Zipper; Thoro-Dri 
Waterproof System; Bloodborne
Pathogen Compliant

$140.39 NA

$116.99 NA

$107.24 NA

$89.04 NA

$89.04 NA



City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:      6/17/14

Price Additional Charges Price Additional Charges Price Additional Charges Price Additional Charges Price Additional Charges

Service Detailed Description
Asbestos Abatement Refer to Scope and Specifications  $          75,000.00 N/A  $            80,000.00 N/A  $              85,000.00 N/A 90,000.00$          N/A
Demolition Refer to Scope and Specifications 515,000.00$        N/A 308,000.00$          N/A 440,000.00$            N/A 317,000.00$       N/A
Parking Lot Removal Refer to Scope and Specifications 30,000.00$          N/A 40,000.00$            N/A 80,000.00$              N/A 60,000.00$          N/A
Grading and Seeding Refer to Scope and Specifications 20,000.00$          N/A 6,000.00$               N/A 20,000.00$              N/A 70,000.00$          N/A

Total Project Cost 640,000.00$                                             434,000.00$                                                 625,000.00$                                                 537,000.00$                                             
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$____5%______ FOR:         DEMOLITION FOR CLARION HOTEL
                

  DEPT:      ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Bid Bond

Off. Ck.





City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     6/17/14

Manufacturer Model Size Count

Delivery 
Made in 
___ Days  Unit Price Manufacturer Model Size Count

Delivery 
Made in 
___ Days  Unit Price Manufacturer Model Size Count

Delivery 
Made in 
___ Days  Unit Price 

DIAL DIA00098 2.5 OZ
200/CS 1-2 DAYS 46.58$    

GOLDENSTAR
GOLHMT1516

60
60" EA 1-2 DAYS 2.46$       

INT-2433-Reg, 
MFG: Aluf/IBS

As per sample 
#3A

24 X 33
1,000

7-14 days 
ARO 26.24$      

INT-2433-L, 
MFG: Aluf/IBS

As per sample 
#3B

24 X 33
1,000

7-14 days 
ARO 18.82$      

INT-2433-L, 
MFG: Aluf/IBS

As per sample 
#3B

24 X 33
1,000

7-14 days 
ARO 18.82$      

INT-2433-L, 
MFG: Aluf/IBS

As per sample 
#3B

24 X 33
1,000

7-14 days 
ARO 18.82$      

INT-3860-XXH, 
MFG: Aluf/IBS

As per sample 
#4A

38 X 60 200
7-14 days 

ARO 25.48$      

INT-3860-X-Hvy, 
MFG: Aluf/IBS

As per sample 
#4B

38 X 60
200

7-14 days 
ARO 21.82$      

INT-3860-XH, 
MFG: Aluf/IBS

As per sample 
#4C

38 X 60
200

7-14 days 
ARO 19.74$      

INT-3860-Exh, 
MFG: Aluf/IBS

As per sample 
#4D

38 X 60
E

7-14 days 
ARO 17.72$      

INT-3340-XXH, 
MFG: Aluf/ IBS

As per sample 
#5A

33 X 40
250

7-14 days 
ARO 18.34$      

INT-3340-XH, 
MFG: Aluf/ IBS

As per sample 
#5B

33 X 40
250

7-14 days 
ARO 15.82$      

INT-3340-Xh, 
MFG: Aluf/ IBS

As per sample 
#5C

33 X 40
250

7-14 days 
ARO 13.84$      

INT-3340-exh, 
MFG: Aluf/ IBS

As per sample 
#5D

33 X 40
250

7-14 days 
ARO 12.20$      

BOARDWALK 20424 24"
EA 1-2 DAYS 10.69$    

GOLDENSTAR GOLBRW58B
EA 1-2 DAYS 5.64$       

SPARTAN BLOC-AID QT
EA 1-2 DAYS 1.94$       

ATHEA
DRAIN AWAY 

255
12/32OZ

12/CS 1-2 DAYS 38.16$    

$21.30/CS

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

1

$17.40/CS

200
7-14 BUS 

DAYS

No Bid

Item #6 - 24" FLOOR BRUSH - THIRTY-SIX (36) MORE OR LESS
Item #7 - WIRE BOUND CORN BROOM - FIFTY (50) MORE OR 

LESS

M
el
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Cash Ck.

2
Item #1 - 2.5 OUNCE BARS HAND SOAP -THREE THOUSAND 

(3,000) MORE OR LESS
Item #2 - THREADED METAL TIP/HARDWOOD HANDLE - 

FIFTY (50) MORE OR LESS

250 1-2 DAYS 16.79$    
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ag

in
g 

Co
rp

or
at

io
n

$___1,000.00_______

24.82$    

INTEPLAST 334016N 33X40 16 MIC

 FOR:       JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

  DEPT:     DPS/FLEET AND FACILITY

Item #11 - NON-FUMING DRAIN CLEANER - TWO HUNDRED 
(200) QUARTS MORE OR LESS

$___2,000.00_______
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

INTEPLAST S386017N 38X60 17 MIC 200 1-2 DAYS

Item #12 - DRAIN OPENER - ONE HUNDRED (100) QUARTS 
MORE OR LESS

Item #4 - 55 GALLON PLASTIC CAN LINER - TEN THOUSAND 
(10,000) MORE OR LESS

Item #5 - 33 GALLON CAN LINER - TWELVE THOUSAND 
(12,000) MORE OR LESS

22.01$    

Item # and Material Description

Item #3 - 12-16 GALLON PLASTIC CAN LINER - TWENTY 
THOUSAND (20,000) MORE OR LESS

S243308NINTEPLAST 24X33 8MIC 1,000 1-2 DAYS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

3

1,000
7-14 BUS 

DAYS

Ce
nt

ra
l P

ol
y-

Ba
g 

Co
rp

.

$___1,000.00_______
Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck.

250
7-14 BUS 

DAYS
$15.90/CS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



UNISAN UNS1036 3X36 EA 1-2 DAYS 10.37$    

SPARTAN SUNNYSIDE GALLON EA 1-2 DAYS 8.38$       

GOLDENSTAR GOLHTA11860 60"
EA 1-2 DAYS 2.20$       

UNGER UNGFE60 24"
EA 1-2 DAYS 15.05$    

LAGASSE PADCS3 SAME
24/CS 1-2 DAYS 25.39$    

GOLDENSTAR
GOLAWM752

4
24 OZ

EA 1-2 DAYS 2.47$       

IMPACT 6G/2635BG SAME EA 1-2 DAYS 28.81$    

IMPACT 6G/2635BG SAME EA 1-2 DAYS 28.81$    

IMPACT WH93 SAME EA 1-2 DAYS 13.04$    

WAUSAU 495000 10 1/8 X 13
2400/CS 1-2 DAYS 15.42$    

BOARDWALK BWK8HOTCUP 8OZ
1000/CS 1-2 DAYS 56.45$    

KIK KIKBLEACH6 GAL
EA 1-2 DAYS 1.59$       

WAUSAU 41000 90/RL 30/CS 1-2 DAYS 16.50$    

SPARTAN CR2 20 OZ EA 1-2 DAYS 3.42$       

WAUSAU BAY 462 8"X350
12/CS 1-2 DAYS 16.1

AJAX CPC14278 21 OZ
EA 1-2 DAYS 0.9

3M MCO35062 19"
5/CS 1-2 DAYS 10.05

WAUSAU BAY14000 1000/RL
96/CS 1-2 DAYS 37.44

BOARDWALK 6217 SAME
EA 1-2 DAYS 2.88

WD40
WDC10383 

LAVA
4 OZ

48/CS 1-2 DAYS 39.84

IMPACT
IMP7732/773

3
SAME

EA 1-2 DAYS 45.94

Monsanto SB701TSP SAME 100LB BAG 1-2 DAYS 175

MALISH MALB2217 20" EA 1-2 DAYS 5.58

3M MCO35032 19" 5/CS 1-2 DAYS 10.05

GP 543-38 SAME
EA 1-2 DAYS

Item #32 - SCOURING POWDER - FIVE HUNDRED (500) CANS 
MORE OR LESS

Item #34 - FLOOR MACHINE BUFFING PAD - TWENTY (20) 
EACH MORE OR LESS

33.81

Item #13 - 36" DUST MOP HEAD - FORTY (40) MORE OR LESS
Item #14 - FLOOR FINISH - ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY (180) 

GALLONS MORE OR LESS

Item #24 - WOODEN MOP HANDLE - TWENTY-FOUR (24) 
MORE OR LESS

Item #25 - C-FOLD BLEACHED WHITE PAPER TOWELS - SIXTY 
(60) MORE OR LESS

Item #26 - PAPER CUP - THIRTY (30) CASES MORE OR LESS

Item #28 - PERFORATED ROLL PAPER TOWEL - THIRTY (30) 
CASES MORE OR LESS

Item #30 - ROACH/ANT SPRAY - FORTY (40) MORE OR LESS

Item #31 - BROWN ROLL PAPER TOWEL - EIGHT HUNDRED 
(800) CASES MORE OR LESS

Item #38 - BARS MECHANIC'S HAND SOAP - THREE 
HUNDRED (300) MORE OR LESS

Item #40 - ROLL TOWEL DISPENSER - TWENTY (20) MORE OR 
LESS

Item #41 - PLASTIC TRASH CONTAINER - FIFTY (50) MORE OR 
LESS

Item #37 - WIRE BOUND TOILET BOWL BRUSH - EIGHTY (80) 
MORE OR LESS

Item #27 - BLEACH - EIGHTY (80) GALLONS MORE OR LESS

Item #15 - 24" FLOOR SQUEEGEE HANDLE - TWENTY (20) 
MORE OR LESS

Item #16 - 24" FLOOR SQUEEGEE - TWENTY (20) MORE OR 
LESS

Item #19 - CELLULOSE SPONGE 7 X 4-5/8 X 2-1/16 - TWO 
HUNDRED (200) MORE OR LESS

Item #21 - 24 OUNCE COTTON MOP HEAD - ONE HUNDRED 
(100) MORE OR LESS

Item #22 - MOP BUCKET WRINGERS - TEN (10) MORE OR 
LESS

Item #23 - MOP BUCKETS - TEN (10) MORE OR LESS

Item #43 - TRI-SODIUM PHOSPHATE - FIVE (5) MORE OR LESS
Item #46 - LONG HANDLE UTILITY BRUSH - SIXTY (60) MORE 

OR LESS
Item #47 - FLOOR MACHINE BUFFING PAD - TWENTY (20) 

MORE OR LESS

Item #35 - TOILET TISSUE - TWO HUNDRED (200) CASES 
MORE OR LESS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



SPARTAN SPA682000 20 OZ
EA 1-2 DAYS 3.15

UNISAN UNS4512 12"
EA 1-2 DAYS 8.02

SPARTAN SPA008404 GALLON
EA 1-2 DAYS 8.3

Unger
UNGNE300/U

NGPR000
SAME

EA 1-2 DAYS 8.96

Item #50 - FLOOR WAX REMOVER - ONE HUNDRED (100) 
GALLONS MORE OR LESS

Item #51 - 12" WINDOW SQUEEGEE - FIFTY (50) MORE OR 
LESS

Item #48 - WASP AND HORNET INSECTICIDE - SIXTY (60) 
MORE OR LESS

Item #49 - LAMBSWOOL WAX APPLICATOR - ONE HUNDRED 
(100) MORE OR LESS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



City of Toledo Bid Sheet

  DATE:     6/17/14

Minimum Order Qty
Price Per Unit to 
Include Delivery Minimum Order Qty

Price Per Unit to 
Include Delivery Minimum Order Qty

Price Per Unit to 
Include Delivery Minimum Order Qty

Price Per Unit to 
Include Delivery

Material Number Material Desceiption
10049713 Liquid Chlorine $307.00

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

$__________ FOR:       800 TONS (MORE OR LESS) LIQUID CHLORINE
                

  DEPT:     DPU/WATER TREATMENT
Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck.

Cash Ck.
Off. Ck.
Cash Ck. Cash Ck.

JC
I J

on
es

 
Ch

em
ic

al
, I

nc
.

$____5%_____ $__________
Bid Bond

4

$__________

1

Cash Ck.

2 3

Bid Bond
Cert. Ck.

Off. Ck.



$____5%_______ $____5%_______ $___100%____ $____5%_______ $___________ $___________
Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond Bid Bond
Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck. Cert. Ck.
Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck. Off. Ck.
Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck. Cash Ck.

Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
Item Number Item Description 1 2 3 4 5 6

1 Purchase and install Tap Box 2,600.00$                     2,500.00$                     4,542.00$                     4,465.00$                     
2 Purchase Starter Panels 96,000.00$                  87,700.00$                  87,088.00$                  92,150.00$                  
3 Labor and Materials to install the Starter Panels 13,000.00$                  7,900.00$                     6,621.00$                     7,500.00$                     
4 Labor and Materials for Panel board Feeders 7,500.00$                     16,427.00$                  15,268.00$                  24,000.00$                  
5 Labor and Materials for Starter Feeders 15,000.00$                  22,000.00$                  23,016.00$                  18,051.00$                  
6 Labor and Materials for Pressure Switches 14,000.00$                  6,480.00$                      $                  13,692.00  $                    1,350.00 
7 Labor and Materials for PLC/Pump/Valve Control Wiring 2,200.00$                     9,200.00$                     9,846.00$                     5,120.00$                     
8 Labor and Materials for NEMA 4X Terminal Boxes 4,300.00$                     2,500.00$                     3,792.00$                     2,400.00$                     
9 Demolition 3,700.00$                     4,520.00$                     4,116.00$                     2,465.00$                     

10 Startup and Commissioning Assistance 6,000.00$                     3,000.00$                     4,673.00$                     4,400.00$                     

11 Training 2,200.00$                     700.00$                        2,495.00$                     2,200.00$                     

Grand Total 166,500.00$                162,927.00$                175,149.00$                164,101.00$                

FOR:       WASHWATER AND ELEVATED TANK PUMP STARTER REPLACEMENTS

DEPT:     DPU/WATER TREATMENT
DATE:     6/17/14
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                                   CITY OF TOLEDO BID SHEET


	6.17.14 Citywide Safety Glasses
	SHEET

	6.17.14 Citywide Safety Shoes
	SHEET

	6.17.14 Clarion Hotel
	SHEET

	6.17.14 Heldman Rd
	6.17.14 Janitorial Supplies
	SHEET

	6.17.14 Liquid Chlorine
	SHEET

	6.17.14 Washwater Pump
	Goods


